
November 26, 2025  |  FTCCI Review  |  1

President
R.Ravi Kumar
Senior Vice-President
K K Maheshwari
Vice-President
Srinivas Garimella
Immediate Past President
Dr. Suresh Kumar Singhal
Secretary
Mattathammal  Veena

Managing Committee

Pankaj Kumar Diwan
Chakravarthi AVPS 
Meela Sanjay   
C V Anirudh Rao
Manoj Kumar Agarwal
Vinod Kumar Agarwal 
S. Chandra Mohan
Rajendra Agarwal
Sanjay  Kumar Agarwal
Alla Balaram Babu
A. Prakash
Prakash Chandra Garg      
Abhishek Tibrewala 
Sushil Kumar Sancheti
Prem Chand Kankaria
Siva Prasad KV
Manish Surana
Naresh Kumar Dasari
Musunuri Ramakrishna Prasad
CA Sudhir VS 
Ashish Pramod Modi
Kripaniwas Sharma
Vinay Kumar Baid
Pawan Kumar Bansal
CA Naresh Chandra Gelli V
B.Sunil Chandra Reddy
Dr. Tasneem Shariff 
Hanmandloo K
P. Krishna 
C.Mithun Chand
Vimalesh Gupta 
Ritesh Mittal
Mohammed Irshad Ahmed
Kukkadapu Srinivas 
Kaushik Gelli

Editorial Board
Chairman
Sri Srinivas Garimella 
Vice President, FTCCI
Members
Dr. M.Gopalakrishna, I.A.S (Retd.)
Sri Devata Rama Kumar,  
Member, FTCCI
Sri Chakravarthi AVPS 
Member, Managing Committee, FTCCI
Editor 
Smt. T.Sujatha, Sr.Director

THE FEDERATION OF TELANGANA CHAMBERS OF COMMERCE & INDUSTRY Vol.VI  No.48 | November 26, 2025 | Rs. 15/-

ISO 9001:2015	           CIN No. U91110TG1964NPL001030

Source :   Labour Bureau, Government of India, 
Shimla

Source :   Directorate of Economics & Statistics, 
	      Govt. of Telangana

1	 2	 3	 4	 5	 6	 7	 8	 9
1.	 Hyderabad	 355	 356	 1	 Miryalaguda	 480	 483	 3
2.	 Warangal	 450	 452	 2	 Kothagudem	 445	 447	 2
					     Nizamabad	 468	 471	 3
	 All India	 422	 424	 2	 Telangana State	 425	 427	 2

SNo.	 Centre          July-25	 Aug-25	 No.of 	 Centre	 Jul-25	 Aug-25	 No.of 	
				    Points				                 Ponits 

Base :: 2001=100
Central Series (2001 = 100)		  State Series (2001 = 100)

Source :   Labour Bureau, Government of India, 
Shimla

Source :   Directorate of Economics & Statistics, 
	      Govt. of Telangana

1	 2	 3	 4	 5	 6	 7	 8	 9
1.	 Hyderabad	 356	 354	 -2	 Miryalaguda	 483	 484	 1
2.	 Warangal	 452	 449	 -3	 Kothagudem	 447	 448	 1
					     Nizamabad	 471	 471	 0
	 All India	 422	 424	 2	 Telangana State	 427	 426	 -1

SNo.	 Centre          Aug-25	 Sep-25	 No.of 	 Centre	 Aug-25	 Sep-25	 No.of 	
				    Points				                 Ponits 

Base :: 2001=100
Central Series (2001 = 100)		  State Series (2001 = 100)

LINKING FACTORS :

                           1960=100    1982=100 2001=100                                1971=100 1982=100 2001=100

1.	Hyderabad	 5.23	 4.79	 2.44	 1.	 Warangal	 2.36	 4.75	 2.97

2.	Kothagudem	 -	 4.58		  2.	 Nizamabad (N.S.B)	 2.52	 4.21	

	 All India	 4.93	 4.63	 2.88	 3.	 Godavarikhani (M.G.P)	 2.49	 4.45	

Directorate of Economics & Statistics,  
GOVERNMENT OF TELANGANA STATE , Hyderabad
Consumer Price Index Numbers for Industrial Workers  

for the month of August 2025

Consumer Price Index Numbers for Industrial Workers  
for the month of September 2025



2  |  November 26, 2025  |  FTCCI Review



November 26, 2025  |  FTCCI Review  |  3

Circular No. 28/2025-Customs
F. No: 473/02/2022-LC
Government of India
Ministry of Finance

Department of Revenue
(Central Board of Indirect Taxes & Customs)

****
North Block, New Delhi

Dated: 15th November, 2025

Subject: Launch of Online Module for Permissions under Section 65 (MOOWR and MOOSWR)-reg.

CBIC  has  operationalised  a  dedicated  online  module  on  ICEGATE 2.0 to streamline and simplify the submission 
of applications for permissions under Section 65 covering the following 2 categories: (a) MOOWR (Manufacture and 
Other Operations in Warehouse Regulations, 2019), applicable to warehouses licensed under Section 58 of the Customs 
Act, 1962; and 
(b) MOOSWR (Manufacture and Other Operations in Special Warehouse Regulations, 2020), applicable to special 
warehouses licensed under Section 58A of the Customs Act, 1962.
2. DG Systems has made available detailed User Manuals for both trade and departmental officers at https://www.
icegate.gov.in/guidelines/warehouse-licensing. These manuals provide clear, stepwise instructions with screenshots of 
the module interface. Users are advised to acquaint themselves with these manuals.
3. Any difficulty in using the module may be reported to icegatehelpdesk@icegate.gov.in. Departmental officers may 
escalate such issues to saksham.seva@icegate.gov.in for timely resolution.
4. Chief Commissioners of Customs shall issue Public Notices indicating the port code(s) to be used for receipt and 
processing of applications for permissions under Section 65 within their jurisdiction and ensure smooth onboarding of 
trade onto the ICEGATE 2.0 module.

(Prabhjot Kaur)
OSD (Cus & EP)

Union Minister for Labour & Employment and Youth Affairs & Sports, Dr. Mansukh Mandaviya, launched the 
Employees’ Enrolment Scheme – 2025 at the 73rd Foundation Day celebrations of the Employees’ Provident Fund 
Organisation (EPFO) in New Delhi. This scheme is a special initiative of the Government of India to promote 
voluntary compliance and extend social security coverage to alleligible employees.

The Employees’ Enrolment Scheme – 2025 provides a special window for employers to voluntarily enrol eligible 
employees who were left out from EPF coverage between 1st July, 2017 and 31st October, 2025, and to regularize their 
past compliance under the Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952.

It further aims to encourage transparency, ensure universal EPF inclusion, and simplify the process of past 
regularization. The Scheme shall remain open for six months, from 1st November, 2025 to 30th April, 2026.

Under this scheme, all establishments, irrespective of existing EPF coverage status, may declare any employee engaged 
by them who joined between 01.07.2017 and 31.10.2025 through the EPFO portal. In respect of such employees, the 
employee’s share has been waived for the declared period if not deducted earlier. The employer’s obligation is limited 
to remit employer’s share, interest (Sec 7Q), administrative charges, and the ₹100 penal damages. A lump-sum penalty 
of ₹100 per establishment will be deemed compliance across the three EPF schemes.

Launch of EPFO’s Employees’ Enrolment Scheme - 2025



Posting at BPC-IV Patrika Channel, Nampally, Hyderabad - 500 001

RNI Reg No. TELENG/2020/79160
No.D/RNP/HCD-5019/2024-26

WPP/No. PMG/TS/HQR/HCD-01/WPP/2023-25
Posting Date : Wednesday / Thursday

The Federation of Telangana 
Chambers of Commerce and Industry
Federation House, Red Hills, Post Box No. 14, 
Lakdikapool,  Hyderabad - 500 004
Ph : 23395515 - 16 /17
e-mail : info@ftcci.in | Website : www.ftcci.in

Editor : T. Sujatha, Sr.Director. Printed at Sri Jain Printers, Red Hills, Hyderabad - 500 004
Publication Received on November 25, 20254  |  November 26, 2025  |  FTCCI Review

Establishments facing inquiries under Section 7A, Para 26B, or Para 8 of EPS-1995 remain eligible, with damages 
limited to ₹100 notionally. No suo-motu compliance action shall be taken by the EPFO.

This scheme is expected to facilitate wider EPF coverage and formalization of the workforce through simplified path 
for employers to regularize past omissions. This is also a giant leap towards strengthening the goal of “Social Security 
for All” and ensuring that every worker is part of India’s organized social safety network.

Posted On: 01 NOV 2025 6:19PM by PIB Delhi

RESERVE BANK OF INDIA  
FOREIGN EXCHANGE DEPARTMENT  

CENTRAL OFFICE  
Mumbai 400 001

Notification No. FEMA 23(R)/(7)/2025-RB 		              November 13, 2025

Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (Second Amendment) Regulations, 2025
In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7, Section 8 and sub-section (2) of section 47 of the Foreign Exchange 
Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999), the Reserve Bank of India makes the following amendments to the Foreign 
Exchange Management (Export of Goods & Services) Regulations, 2015 [Notification No. FEMA 23(R)/2015-RB 
dated January 12, 2016] (hereinafter referred to as ‘the Principal Regulations’), namely:

1. Short Title and Commencement:-
(i) These regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (Second 
Amendment) Regulations, 2025

(ii) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment to Regulation 9:-
In the principal regulations, in regulation 9 -
(i) in sub-regulation (1) for the words ‘nine months’, the words ‘fifteen months’ shall be substituted.
(ii) in sub-regulation (2), in clause (a) for the words ‘nine months’, the words ‘fifteen months’ shall be substituted.

3. Amendment to Regulation 15:-
In the principal regulations, in regulation 15 -
(i) in sub-regulation (1), in clause (i) for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.
(ii) in proviso to sub-regulation (1), for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.
(iii) in sub-regulation (2), for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.

(Rohit P. Das)  
Regional Director


